
Alt 17 5 550 00$ 552 51$

VERSAILLES EXEMPTED VILLAGE SCHOOL DISTRICT
New K-12 Building

Versailles, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #11:  LOOSE FURNISHINGS BID PACKAGE ESTIMATE 902,376$                      

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5

Bid due…2-25-10, 2:00pm Farnham Tom Sexton

#REF!
Addendum #1…2-19-10 X X

-

BASE BID: 827,400.00$            687,950.88$            
      Alternate 1 9,100.00$                8,862.61$                

Alternate 2 4,000.00$                3,290.84$                

Alternate 3 8,400.00$                5,713.95$                

Alternate 4 14,900.00$              11,031.75$              

Alternate 5 1,200.00$                897.34$                   

Alternate 6 450.00$                   668.85$                   

Alternate 7 700.00$                   534.70$                   

Alternate 8 2,600.00$                870.04$                   

Alternate 9 350.00$                   200.53$                   

Alternate 10 700.00$                   182.78$                   

Alternate 11 1,400.00$                606.69$                   

Alternate 12 550.00$                   350.11$                   

Alternate 13 500.00$                   384.03$                   

Alternate 14 550.00$                   432.00$                   

Alternate 15 500.00$                   370.76$                   

Alternate 16 6,500.00$                6,630.07$                

Alternate 17ernate 5 550 00$ , .               552 51$ .                  

Alternate 18 4,650.00$                1,657.54$                

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X X



Alternate 14 NO BID NO BID NO BID

VERSAILLES EXEMPTED VILLAGE SCHOOL DISTRICT
New K-12 Building

Versailles, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #12:  PLAYGROUND & SITE EQ. BID PACKAGE ESTIMATE 228,132$                      

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5

Bid due…2-25-10, 2:00pm Service Supply DEITERING 
LANDSCAPING, INC. Anderson Rec. Design

#REF!
Addendum #1…2-19-10 X X X

-

BASE BID: 201,813.00$            218,500.00$            183,790.00$            

      Alternate 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 6 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 7 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 9 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 11 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 13 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 14 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Alternate 15 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 16 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 17 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 18 NO BID NO BID NO BID

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X X X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X X X



VERSAILLES EXEMPTED VILLAGE SCHOOL DISTRICT
New K-12 Building

Versailles, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #9 - ACCESS ROAD SITEWORK ESTIMATE 131,620$                      

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8

Bid Date 6-25-09, 2:00pm Tom's Construction Inc. Double Jay 
Construction, Inc.

Brumbaugh 
Construction, Inc.

R.D. Jones Excavating, 
Inc.

Addendum Issued:
#1 Dated June 22nd, 2009 X X X X

BASE BID: 192,709.00$                 181,300.00$                 204,800.00$                 196,500.00$                 

      Alternate 1 144,624.00$                144,850.00$                141,800.00$                99,600.00$                  

Alternate 2 46,573.00$                   20,580.00$                   49,300.00$                   115,000.00$                 

Alternate 3 6,530.00$                     6,000.00$                     4,500.00$                     8,000.00$                     

Alternate 4 5,096.00$                     5,200.00$                     9,500.00$                     4,400.00$                     

TOTAL w/ ALTS. EXCEPT ALT 2  395,532.00$                 337,350.00$                 360,600.00$                 308,500.00$                 
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X X X X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X X X X

NOTE:  Bids rejected.  Project to be rebid at a later date.



VERSAILLES EXEMPTED VILLAGE SCHOOL DISTRICT
New K-12 Building

Versailles, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #10 - ACCESS ROAD ELECTRICAL WORK ESTIMATE 86,200$                         

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8

Bid Date 6-25-09, 2:00pm Reese Electric, Inc. Bender Electrical 
Contracting, LTD. Chapel Electric Co., LLC

Addendums Issued:
#1 Dated June 22nd, 2009 X X X

BASE BID: 34,690.00$                    49,048.00$                    42,950.00$                    

      Alternate 1 N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 2 N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 3 N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 4 N/A N/A N/A

TOTAL w/ ALTS.  34,690.00$                    49,048.00$                    42,950.00$                    
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X X X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X X X

NOTE:  Bids rejected.  Project to be rebid at a later date.



VERSAILLES EXEMPTED VILLAGE SCHOOL DISTRICT
New K-12 Building

Versailles, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY#: 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, and 8

DESCRIPTION

Bid Due Date: April 23, 2008 at 3:30 pm ADVERTISED BASE
ESTIMATE BID AMOUNT

Addendums Issued:
#01 Dated April 11, 2008 
#02 Dated April 17, 2008 

SQFT= 225,821
BID ITEM SUMMARY: SF Cost
BID CATEGORY #1 - SITEWORK 1,960,810$         -$                                PETERSON COMBO -$                                
BID CATEGORY #2 - GENERAL TRADES 17,959,115$       18,655,000.00$              PETERSON COMBO 82.61$                            
BID CATEGORY #3 - FOOD SERVICE EQUIPMENT 518,500$            604,900.00$                   WASSERSTROM CO 2.68$                              
BID CATEGORY #4 - PLUMBING SYSTEMS 1,250,560$         -$                                GM MECHANICAL -$                                
BID CATEGORY #5 - FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEM 456,160$            532,618.00$                   TRISCO 2.36$                              
BID CATEGORY #6 - MECHANICAL SYSTEMS 3,786,320$         4,490,000.00$                GM MECHANICAL 19.88$                            
BID CATEGORY #7 - ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS 3,173,845$         3,464,000.00$                CHAPEL ELECTRIC 15.34$                            

BID CATEGORY #8 - TECHNOLOGY SYSTEM 439,000$            298,150.00$                   
STRUCTURED 

CABLING SYSTEMS 1.32$                              
-$                                

BIDDING TOTALS $29,544,310 $28,044,668

Variance To Estimate - (Under) / Over: ($1,499,642)

Base Bid Plus Alternates:
Budget for Bid Categories 1-8: -$                    

-$                    

APPARENT LOW BIDDER



VERSAILLES EXEMPTED VILLAGE SCHOOL DISTRICT
New K-12 Building

Versailles, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #2 - GENERAL TRADES BID PACKAGE ESTIMATE 17,959,115$                  

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5

Bid Due Date: April 23, 2008 at 3:30 pm BUMBRAUGH 
CONSTRUCTION

PETERSON 
CONSTRUCTION

FERGUSON 
CONSTRUCTION

MONARCH 
CONSTRUCTION

Addendums Issued:
#01 Dated April 11, 2008 X X X X
#02 Dated April 17, 2008 X X X X

0
0

BASE BID: 19,180,000.00$      16,997,000.00$      17,495,000.00$      18,737,000.00$      
      Alternate 1 203,000.00$           190,000.00$           192,000.00$           174,000.00$           

Alternate 2 20,000.00$             19,500.00$             

Alternate 3

Alternate 4 30,000.00$             59,000.00$             30,000.00$             

Alternate 5 (300,000.00)$          (300,000.00)$          (321,000.00)$          (308,000.00)$          

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X X X X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X X X X



VERSAILLES EXEMPTED VILLAGE SCHOOL DISTRICT
New K-12 Building

Versailles, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #5 - FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEM BID PACKAGE ESTIMATE 456,160$                       

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5

Bid Due Date: April 23, 2008 at 3:30 pm A1 SPRINKLER CO TRISCO/SIMPLEX 
GRINNELL

CENTRAL FIRE 
PROTECTION

Addendums Issued:
#01 Dated April 11, 2008 X X X
#02 Dated April 17, 2008 X X X

0
0

BASE BID: 587,115.00$                  532,618.00$                  651,700.00$                  

      Alternate 1

Alternate 2

Alternate 3 8,000.00$                      

Alternate 4

Alternate 5

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X X X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X X X



VERSAILLES EXEMPTED VILLAGE SCHOOL DISTRICT
New K-12 Building

Versailles, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #6 - MECHANICAL SYSTEMS BID PACKAGE ESTIMATE 3,786,320$                    

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5

Bid Due Date: April 23, 2008 at 3:30 pm REGAL PLUMBING & 
HEATING CO. SLAGLE MECHANICAL G M MECHANICAL

Addendums Issued:
#01 Dated April 11, 2008 X X X
#02 Dated April 17, 2008 X X X

0
0

BASE BID: 3,345,084.00$               3,460,000.00$               3,320,000.00$               

      Alternate 1

Alternate 2

Alternate 3 43,437.00$                    54,000.00$                    43,000.00$                    

Alternate 4

Alternate 5

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X



VERSAILLES EXEMPTED VILLAGE SCHOOL DISTRICT
New K-12 Building

Versailles, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #7 - ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS BID PACKAGE ESTIMATE 3,173,845$                    

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5

Bid Due Date: April 23, 2008 at 3:30 pm WOOLACE 
ELECTRICAL

CHAPEL ELECTRIC 
CO.

AREA ENERGY & 
ELECTRIC SOLLMANN ELECTRIC

Addendums Issued:
#01 Dated April 11, 2008 X X X X
#02 Dated April 17, 2008 X X X X

0
0

BASE BID: 3,580,000.00$               3,464,000.00$               4,119,600.00$               3,824,000.00$               

      Alternate 1

Alternate 2

Alternate 3 2,800.00$                      1,250.00$                      1,500.00$                      1,180.00$                      

Alternate 4

Alternate 5

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X X X X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X X X X



VERSAILLES EXEMPTED VILLAGE SCHOOL DISTRICT
New K-12 Building

Versailles, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #4 - PLUMBING SYSTEMS BID PACKAGE ESTIMATE 1,250,560$                    

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5

Bid Due Date: April 23, 2008 at 3:30 pm STARCO, INC OHIO PLUMBING & 
ELECTRICAL INC. SLAGLE MECHANICAL G M MECHANICAL

Addendums Issued:
#01 Dated April 11, 2008 X X X X
#02 Dated April 17, 2008 X X X X

0
0

BASE BID: 1,570,000.00$               1,224,000.00$               1,850,000.00$               1,370,000.00$               

      Alternate 1

Alternate 2

Alternate 3

Alternate 4

Alternate 5

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X X



VERSAILLES EXEMPTED VILLAGE SCHOOL DISTRICT
New K-12 Building

Versailles, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #3 - FOOD SERVICE EQUIPMENT BID PACKAGE ESTIMATE 518,500$                       

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5

Bid Due Date: April 23, 2008 at 3:30 pm
BRECKENRIDGE 

KITCHEN 
EQUIPMENT

BUSHONG 
RESTAURANT 

EQUIP

BRYSCO 
FOODSERVICE

C & T DESIGN & 
EQUIPMENT

THE 
WASSERSTROM 

CO.
Addendums Issued:

#01 Dated April 11, 2008 X X X X X
#02 Dated April 17, 2008 X X X X X

0
0

BASE BID: 665,336.00$           677,100.00$           620,305.00$           679,540.00$           604,900.00$           
      Alternate 1

Alternate 2

Alternate 3

Alternate 4

Alternate 5

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X X X X X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X X X X X



VERSAILLES EXEMPTED VILLAGE SCHOOL DISTRICT
New K-12 Building

Versailles, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #1 - SITEWORK BID PACKAGE ESTIMATE 1,960,810$                    

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8

Bid Due Date: April 23, 2008 at 3:30 pm Kelchner Performance Site 
Company

Bruns General 
Contracting George Igel & Co. RD JONES TRUCCO 

CONSTRUCTION CO
CHARLES H. 

HAMILTON COMPANY
PETERSON 

CONSTRUCTION

Addendums Issued:
#01 Dated April 11, 2008 X X X X X X X
#02 Dated April 17, 2008 X X X X X X X

0
0

BASE BID: 1,672,338.00$          2,060,000.00$          1,809,861.00$          2,210,900.00$          1,696,000.00$          1,963,000.00$          1,742,000.00$          1,900,000.00$          
      Alternate 1

Alternate 2 17,710.00$               21,150.00$               22,000.00$               16,990.00$               20,000.00$               17,000.00$               12,750.00$               20,000.00$               

Alternate 3

Alternate 4

Alternate 5

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X X X X X X X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X X X X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X X X X X X X



VERSAILLES EXEMPTED VILLAGE SCHOOL DISTRICT
New K-12 Building

Versailles, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #8 - TECHNOLOGY SYSTEM BID PACKAGE ESTIMATE 439,000$                       

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5

Bid Due Date: April 23, 2008 at 3:30 pm STRUCTURED 
CABLING SYSTEMS CTS TECHNOLOGIES SECURCOM, INC.

OHIO VALLEY 
INTEGRATION 

SERVICES

CHAPEL ROMANOFF 
TECHNOLOGIES, LLC

Addendums Issued:
#01 Dated April 11, 2008 X X X X X
#02 Dated April 17, 2008 X X X X X

0
0

BASE BID: 298,150.00$           443,670.00$           398,900.00$           406,000.00$           379,000.00$           
      Alternate 1

Alternate 2

Alternate 3

Alternate 4

Alternate 5

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X X X X X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X X X X X



VERSAILLES EXEMPTED VILLAGE SCHOOL DISTRICT
New K-12 Building

Versailles, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY COMBINATION BIDS

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6

Bid Due Date: April 23, 2008 at 3:30 pm PETERSON Ferguson SLAGLE MECHANICAL G M MECHANICAL CHAPEL ELECTRIC AREA ENERGY

Addendums Issued:
#01 Dated April 11, 2008 X
#02 Dated April 17, 2008 X

0
0

BID CATEGORIES OF COMBINATION BID: 1&2 1&2 4&6 4 & 6 7&8 7&8

COMBINATION BASE BID: 18,655,000.00$       19,235,000.00$       5,200,000.00$         4,490,000.00$         3,832,000.00$         4,515,000.00$         

      Alternate 1 190,000.00$            192,000.00$            

Alternate 2

Alternate 3 54,000.00$              43,000.00$              1,250.00$                1,500.00$                

Alternate 4 30,000.00$              

Alternate 5

TOTAL w/ ALTS.  18,875,000.00$       
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X
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