
FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
MILLSTREAM - CAREER TECHNICAL CENTER

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY "2"  - GENERAL TRADES

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8

Bid Due Date: May 12, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value CHARLES CLOUSE HUMBLE ALVADA MEL LANZER TELAMON
Bid Package #02 8,798,347.00$                

Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1  - April 28, 2011 X X X X X X
Addendum No. 2  -    May 5, 2011 X X X X X X
Addendum No. 3 -     May 9, 2011 X X X X X X

BASE BID: 8,351,600.00$                9,020,584.00$                8,840,000.00$                9,062,000.00$                9,011,000.00$                7,840,000.00$                

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt 163,900.00$                   (179,013.00)$                  382,000.00$                   283,000.00$                   BLANK 198,000.00$                   

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 NO CHANGE -$                                -$                                NO CHANGE BLANK -$                                

AlLTERNATE #03 - Solar Collectors NO CHANGE -$                                -$                                NO CHANGE -$                                -$                                

ALTERNATE #04 - Solar Thermal NO CHANGE -$                                -$                                NO CHANGE -$                                -$                                

ALTERNATE #05 - Rainwater Storage NO CHANGE -$                                -$                                NO CHANGE -$                                -$                                

ALTERNATE #06 - Staff Courtyard (South) 27,800.00$                     40,910.00$                     33,000.00$                     42,000.00$                     22,000.00$                     28,000.00$                     

ALTERNATE #07 - Main Courtyard (between buildings) 118,200.00$                   146,332.00$                   120,000.00$                   128,800.00$                   92,000.00$                     94,000.00$                     

ALTERNATE #08 - West Area South of Parking Lot - Asphalt 32,300.00$                     26,525.00$                     57,000.00$                     49,700.00$                     40,000.00$                     44,000.00$                     
ALTERNATE #09 - West Area South of Parking Lot - 
Concrete 55,800.00$                     45,684.00$                     79,000.00$                     118,500.00$                   40,000.00$                     58,000.00$                     

ALTERNATE #10 - Shop Equipment Relocation 12,600.00$                     6,955.00$                       4,500.00$                       59,068.00$                     39,950.00$                     24,000.00$                     

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X X X X X X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X X X X



FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
MILLSTREAM - CAREER TECHNICAL CENTER

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY "3"  - ROOFING

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8

KELLEY 
Bid Due Date: May 12, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value HAROLD J CRM INC. BROTHERS FROST RAME INC.
Bid Package #02 992,400.00$                    BECKER ROOFING ROOFING, INC

Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1  - April 28, 2011 X X X X X
Addendum No. 2  -    May 5, 2011 X X X X X
Addendum No. 3 -     May 9, 2011 X X X X X

BASE BID: 1,142,000.00$                 797,700.00$                    787,000.00$                    992,000.00$                    879,500.00$                    

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt NO BID NO BID NO CHANGE NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 NO BID NO BID NO CHANGE NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

AlLTERNATE #03 - Solar Collectors NO BID NO BID NO CHANGE NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #04 - Solar Thermal NO BID 2,400.00$                        1,000.00$                        6,500.00$                        10,000.00$                      

ALTERNATE #05 - Rainwater Storage NO BID NO BID NO CHANGE NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #06 - Staff Courtyard (South) NO BID NO BID NO CHANGE NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #07 - Main Courtyard (between buildings) NO BID NO BID NO CHANGE NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #08 - West Area South of Parking Lot - Asphalt NO BID NO BID NO CHANGE NO CHANGE NO CHANGE
ALTERNATE #09 - West Area South of Parking Lot - 
Concrete NO BID NO BID NO CHANGE NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #10 - Shop Equipment Relocation NO BID NO BID NO CHANGE NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X X X X X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X X X



FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
MILLSTREAM - CAREER TECHNICAL CENTER

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY "4"  - FOOD SERVICE

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8

THE BURKETT BRECKENRIDGE
Bid Due Date: May 12, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value WASSERSTROM RESTAURANT STAFFORD C&T DESIGN KITCHEN EQUIPMENT
Bid Package #02 280,000.00$                    COMPANY EQUIPMENT SMITH, INC & EQUIPMENT & DESIGN

Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1  - April 28, 2011 X X X X X
Addendum No. 2  -    May 5, 2011 X X X X X
Addendum No. 3 -     May 9, 2011 X X X X X

BASE BID: 298,810.00$                    265,500.00$                    296,025.00$                    274,400.00$                    276,020.00$                    

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt BLANK BLANK -$                                NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 BLANK BLANK -$                                NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

AlLTERNATE #03 - Solar Collectors BLANK BLANK -$                                NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #04 - Solar Thermal BLANK BLANK -$                                NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #05 - Rainwater Storage BLANK BLANK -$                                NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #06 - Staff Courtyard (South) BLANK BLANK -$                                NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #07 - Main Courtyard (between buildings) BLANK BLANK -$                                NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #08 - West Area South of Parking Lot - Asphalt BLANK BLANK -$                                NO CHANGE NO CHANGE
ALTERNATE #09 - West Area South of Parking Lot - 
Concrete BLANK BLANK -$                                NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #10 - Shop Equipment Relocation BLANK BLANK -$                                NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X X X X X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X X X



FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
MILLSTREAM - CAREER TECHNICAL CENTER

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY "5"  - FIRE PROTECTION

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8

Bid Due Date: May 12, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value BORDER FIRE VULCAN ACCEL
Bid Package #02 162,390.00$                   PROTECTION ENTERPRISES FIRE SYSTEMS

Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1  - April 28, 2011 X X X
Addendum No. 2  -    May 5, 2011 X X X
Addendum No. 3 -     May 9, 2011 X X X

BASE BID: 162,000.00$                   150,540.00$                   151,500.00$                   

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt BLANK NO CHANGE -$                                

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 BLANK NO CHANGE -$                                

AlLTERNATE #03 - Solar Collectors BLANK NO CHANGE -$                                

ALTERNATE #04 - Solar Thermal BLANK NO CHANGE -$                                

ALTERNATE #05 - Rainwater Storage BLANK NO CHANGE -$                                

ALTERNATE #06 - Staff Courtyard (South) BLANK NO CHANGE -$                                

ALTERNATE #07 - Main Courtyard (between buildings) BLANK NO CHANGE -$                                

ALTERNATE #08 - West Area South of Parking Lot - Asphalt BLANK NO CHANGE -$                                
ALTERNATE #09 - West Area South of Parking Lot - 
Concrete BLANK NO CHANGE -$                                

ALTERNATE #10 - Shop Equipment Relocation BLANK NO CHANGE -$                                

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X X X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X



FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
MILLSTREAM - CAREER TECHNICAL CENTER

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY "6"  - PLUMBING

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8

MARLIN P
Bid Due Date: May 12, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value L R BABCOCK WHITE & WARNER SLAGLE
Bid Package #02 650,031.00$                    PLMBG & HEATING SONS MECHANICAL CORP MECHANICAL

Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1  - April 28, 2011 X X X X
Addendum No. 2  -    May 5, 2011 X X X X
Addendum No. 3 -     May 9, 2011 X X X X

BASE BID: 835,545.00$                    821,000.00$                    723,720.00$                    612,000.00$                    

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt -$                                 NO CHANGE NO BID -$                                 

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 -$                                 NO CHANGE NO BID -$                                 

AlLTERNATE #03 - Solar Collectors -$                                 NO CHANGE NO BID -$                                 

ALTERNATE #04 - Solar Thermal 44,230.00$                      37,500.00$                      227,714.00$                    30,700.00$                      

ALTERNATE #05 - Rainwater Storage 290,000.00$                    251,000.00$                    80,046.00$                      207,000.00$                    

ALTERNATE #06 - Staff Courtyard (South) -$                                 NO CHANGE NO BID -$                                 

ALTERNATE #07 - Main Courtyard (between buildings) 2,634.00$                        2,350.00$                        3,900.00$                        1,500.00$                        

ALTERNATE #08 - West Area South of Parking Lot - Asphalt -$                                 NO CHANGE NO BID -$                                 
ALTERNATE #09 - West Area South of Parking Lot - 
Concrete -$                                 NO CHANGE NO BID -$                                 

ALTERNATE #10 - Shop Equipment Relocation -$                                 NO CHANGE NO BID -$                                 

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X X X X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X X



FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
MILLSTREAM - CAREER TECHNICAL CENTER

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY "7"  - HVAC

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8

Bid Due Date: May 12, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value WARNER SLAGLE HOFFMAN VM SYSTEMS VAUGHN
Bid Package #02 1,438,600.00$                 MECHANICAL INC MECHANICAL & HARPST INDUSTRIES

Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1  - April 28, 2011 X X X X X
Addendum No. 2  -    May 5, 2011 X X X X X
Addendum No. 3 -     May 9, 2011 X X X X X

BASE BID: 1,606,221.00$                 1,945,000.00$                 1,719,000.00$                 1,844,700.00$                 2,060,000.00$                 

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt NO BID -$                                 -$                                 N/A NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 NO BID -$                                 -$                                 N/A 57,500.00$                      

AlLTERNATE #03 - Solar Collectors NO BID -$                                 -$                                 N/A 8,400.00$                        

ALTERNATE #04 - Solar Thermal 227,714.00$                    30,700.00$                      -$                                 N/A 700.00$                           

ALTERNATE #05 - Rainwater Storage 80,046.00$                      207,000.00$                    -$                                 N/A 600.00$                           

ALTERNATE #06 - Staff Courtyard (South) NO BID -$                                 -$                                 N/A 6,200.00$                        

ALTERNATE #07 - Main Courtyard (between buildings) 3,900.00$                        1,500.00$                        -$                                 N/A 14,500.00$                      

ALTERNATE #08 - West Area South of Parking Lot - Asphalt NO BID -$                                 -$                                 N/A NO CHANGE
ALTERNATE #09 - West Area South of Parking Lot - 
Concrete NO BID -$                                 -$                                 N/A NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #10 - Shop Equipment Relocation NO BID -$                                 -$                                 N/A NO CHANGE

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X X X X X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X X X



FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
MILLSTREAM - CAREER TECHNICAL CENTER

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY "8"  - ELECTRICAL

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8

Bid Due Date: May 12, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value VAUGHN KOESTER SOLLMANN LAKE ERIE
Bid Package #02 1,949,930.00$                 INDUSTRIES ELECTRIC ELECTRIC CO ELECTRIC

Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1  - April 28, 2011 X X X X
Addendum No. 2  -    May 5, 2011 X X X X
Addendum No. 3 -     May 9, 2011 X X X X

BASE BID: 2,139,000.00$                 2,098,000.00$                 2,185,571.00$                 2,127,757.00$                 

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt NO CHANGE -$                                 -$                                 NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 57,500.00$                      62,500.00$                      56,091.00$                      50,000.00$                      

AlLTERNATE #03 - Solar Collectors 8,400.00$                        21,000.00$                      17,211.00$                      18,931.00$                      

ALTERNATE #04 - Solar Thermal 700.00$                           1,000.00$                        353.00$                           1,500.00$                        

ALTERNATE #05 - Rainwater Storage 600.00$                           4,000.00$                        3,208.00$                        1,500.00$                        

ALTERNATE #06 - Staff Courtyard (South) 6,200.00$                        6,500.00$                        8,117.00$                        8,870.00$                        

ALTERNATE #07 - Main Courtyard (between buildings) 14,500.00$                      13,500.00$                      19,139.00$                      10,999.00$                      

ALTERNATE #08 - West Area South of Parking Lot - Asphalt NO CHANGE -$                                 -$                                 NO CHANGE
ALTERNATE #09 - West Area South of Parking Lot - 
Concrete NO CHANGE -$                                 -$                                 NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #10 - Shop Equipment Relocation NO CHANGE -$                                 -$                                 NO CHANGE

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X X X X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X X



FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
DONNELL - MIDDLE SCHOOL

GLENWOOD - MIDDLE SCHOOL
MILLSTREAM - CAREER TECHNICAL CENTER

FINDLAY, OHIO

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY "10"  - TEMPERATURE CONTROLS - MILLSTREAM, DONNELL, GLENWOOD

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8

CONTROL
Bid Due Date: May 12, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value TRANE WADSWORTH SYSTEMS JOHNSON HONEYWELL
Bid Package #02 809,530.00$                    & ASSOCIATES OF OHIO CONTROL INTERNATIONAL

Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1  - April 28, 2011 X X X X X
Addendum No. 2  -    May 5, 2011 X X X X X
Addendum No. 3 -     May 9, 2011 X X X X X

BASE BID: 1,100,000.00$                 748,500.00$                    748,600.00$                    675,900.00$                    712,272.00$                    

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt N/A NO CHANGE NO CHANGE BLANK BLANK

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 N/A NO CHANGE NO CHANGE BLANK BLANK

AlLTERNATE #03 - Solar Collectors N/A NO CHANGE NO CHANGE BLANK BLANK

ALTERNATE #04 - Solar Thermal N/A NO CHANGE NO CHANGE BLANK BLANK

ALTERNATE #05 - Rainwater Storage N/A NO CHANGE NO CHANGE BLANK BLANK

ALTERNATE #06 - Staff Courtyard (South) N/A NO CHANGE NO CHANGE BLANK BLANK

ALTERNATE #07 - Main Courtyard (between buildings) N/A NO CHANGE NO CHANGE BLANK BLANK

ALTERNATE #08 - West Area South of Parking Lot - Asphalt N/A NO CHANGE NO CHANGE BLANK BLANK
ALTERNATE #09 - West Area South of Parking Lot - 
Concrete N/A NO CHANGE NO CHANGE BLANK BLANK

ALTERNATE #10 - Shop Equipment Relocation N/A NO CHANGE NO CHANGE BLANK BLANK

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X X X X X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X X X



FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
MILLSTREAM - CAREER TECHNICAL CENTER

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY COMBINATION BIDS

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8

Bid Due Date: May 12, 2011 2:30 PM SLAGLE
Bid Package #02

Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1  - April 28, 2011 X
Addendum No. 2  -    May 5, 2011 X
Addendum No. 3 -     May 9, 2011 X

COMBINATION BASE BID:

Plumbing & HVAC 2,532,000.00$                

General Trades & Roofing

Plumbing & HVAC & Electrical

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt -$                               

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 -$                               

AlLTERNATE #03 - Solar Collectors -$                               

ALTERNATE #04 - Solar Thermal 30,700.00$                     

ALTERNATE #05 - Rainwater Storage 207,000.00$                   

ALTERNATE #06 - Staff Courtyard (South) -$                               

ALTERNATE #07 - Main Courtyard (between buildings) 1,500.00$                       

ALTERNATE #08 - West Area South of Parking Lot - Asphalt -$                               

ALTERNATE #09 - West Area South of Parking Lot - Concrete -$                               

ALTERNATE #10 - Shop Equipment Relocation -$                               

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X
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