FREMONT CITY SCHOOLS

New Middle School

Fremont, OH
BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #8 - Loose Furniture BID PACKAGE ESTIMATE| $ 230,228
VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8
Bid Due Date: June 15, 2011 at 2:00 pm Continental Tom Sexton

Addendums Issued:

#01 Dated June 3, 2011

x| X
x

#02 Dated June 8, 2011

BASE BID: $169,185.91 $174,939.20

Alternate 1 - 55 student chairs CH-1

Alternate 2 - 55 student desks D-1

Alternate 3 - Provide CH-4 items

Alternate 4 - Provide CR-1 items

Alternate 5- Provide HD-1 items

Alternate 6 - Provide TB-3 items

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS

BID FORM

BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND

X|X|Xx
X|X|Xx

POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY




FREMONT CITY SCHOOLS

New Middle School

Fremont, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #9 - Office Furniture BID PACKAGE ESTIMATE 206,726
VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8
Bid Due Date: June 15, 2011 at 2:00 pm Continental Tom Sexton Elements IV
Addendums Issued:
#01 Dated June 3, 2011 X X X
#02 Dated June 8, 2011 X X X
BASE BID: $ 178,179.67 187,243.90 198,762.00
Alternate 1 - 55 student chairs CH-1
Alternate 2 - 55 student desks D-1
Alternate 3 - Provide CH-4 items| $ 60,467.40 71,986.11 66,300.00
Alternate 4 - Provide CR-1 items
Alternate 5- Provide HD-1 items| $ 13,308.64 13,808.90 15,400.00
Alternate 6 - Provide TB-3 items| $ 4,115.40 4,188.53 3,750.00
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X X X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X X X




FREMONT CITY SCHOOLS

New Middle School

Fremont, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY

BID CATEGORY #10 - School Specialties BID PACKAGE ESTIMATE 244,319
VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8
Bid Due Date: June 15, 2011 at 2:00 pm Continental Tom Sexton
Addendums Issued:
#01 Dated June 3, 2011 X X
#02 Dated June 8, 2011 X X
BASE BID: $ 244,696.62 239,476.81
Alternate 1 - 55 student chairs CH-1| $ 3,474.35 3,146.06
Alternate 2 - 55 student desks D-1| $ 4,148.10 4,729.30
Alternate 3 - Provide CH-4 items
Alternate 4 - Provide CR-1 items| $ 7,127.47 7,121.89
Alternate 5- Provide HD-1 items
Alternate 6 - Provide TB-3 items|
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X X




FREMONT CITY SCHOOLS

New Middle School

Fremont, OH
BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #11 - Video Distribution, Clocks, Intercom BID PACKAGE ESTIMATE| $ 352,769
VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8
Bid Due Date: June 15, 2011 at 2:00 pm Torrence Sound Valley Accent Transtar Southeast
Addendums Issued:
#01 Dated June 3, 2011 X X X X X
#02 Dated June 8, 2011 X X X X X
BASE BID: $ 490,000.00 | $ 387,340.00 | $ 438,000.00 | $ 460,000.00 | $ 432,000.00
Alternate 1 - Equipment 274195 Media Management System| $ 109,500.00 | $ 84,700.00 | $ 145,000.00 no bid $ 120,000.00
Alternate 2 - Equipment 274163 Digital Television Studio| $ 243,800.00 | $ 130,950.00 | $ 102,000.00 no bid $ 59,587.00
Alternate 3 - Equipment 274153 Interactive Whiteboards| $ 104,800.00 | $ 99,800.00 | $ 165,000.00 | $ 127,900.00 | $ 91,257.00
Alternate 4 - Equipment 274154 Integrated A/V Accessories| $ 28,600.00 | $ 21,250.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 8,142.00
Alternate 5 - Equipment 272133 Data Communications Wireless
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X X X X X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X X X X X




FREMONT CITY SCHOOLS

New Middle School

Fremont, OH
BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #12 - Network Electronics & Voice Over IP BiD PACKAGE ESTIMATE, 265,646
VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8
Bid Due Date: June 15, 2011 at 2:00 pm Microman Transtar
Addendums Issued:
#01 Dated June 3, 2011 X X
#02 Dated June 8, 2011 X X
BASE BID: $ 265,081.00 270,800.00
Alternate 1 - Equipment 274195 Media Management System
Alternate 2 - Equipment 274163 Digital Television Studio
Alternate 3 - Equipment 274153 Interactive Whiteboards
Alternate 4 - Equipment 274154 Integrated A/V Accessories
Alternate 5 - Equipment 272133 Data Communications Wireless| $ 38,309.00 36,000.00

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM

BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND

POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY

X|X|x

X|X|x




FREMONT CITY SCHOOLS

New Middle School

Fremont, OH
BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY #13 - Securtiy System BID PACKAGE ESTIMATE 135,102
VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8
Bid Due Date: June 15, 2011 at 2:00 pm SecurCom, Inc. Accent Transtar
Addendums Issued:
#01 Dated June 3, 2011 X X X
#02 Dated June 8, 2011 X X X
BASE BID: $ 129,800.00 | $ 194,000.00 188,000.00
Alternate 1 - Equipment 274195 Media Management System
Alternate 2 - Equipment 274163 Digital Television Studio
Alternate 3 - Equipment 274153 Interactive Whiteboards
Alternate 4 - Equipment 274154 Integrated A/V Accessories
Alternate 5 - Equipment 272133 Data Communications Wireless
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X X X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X X X




New Middle School
Fremont, OH
BID TABULATION SUMMARY COMBINATION BIDS
VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8
Bid Due Date: June 15, 2011 at 2:00 pm Tom Sexton Accent Transtar
Addendums Issued:
#01 Dated June 3, 2011 X X X
#02 Dated June 8, 2011 X X X
BID CATEGORIES OF COMBINATION BID 8.9, 10 11 and 13 11,12, 13
COMBINATION BASE BID: $ 600,000.00 | $ 625,000.00 | $ 917,000.00
Furniture
Alternate 1 - 55 student chairs CH-1| $ 3,146.06
Alternate 2 - 55 student desks D-1| $ 4,729.30
Alternate 3 - Provide CH-4 items| $ 71,986.11
Alternate 4 - Provide CR-1 items| $ 7,121.89
Alternate 5- Provide HD-1 items| $ 13,808.90
Alternate 6 - Provide TB-3 items| $ 4,188.53
Technology
Alternate 1 - Equipment 274195 Media Management System $ 145,000.00 no bid
Alternate 2 - Equipment 274163 Digital Television Studio $ 102,000.00 no bid
Alternate 3 - Equipment 274153 Interactive Whiteboards $ 165,000.00 | $ 127,900.00
Alternate 4 - Equipment 274154 Integrated A/V Accessories $ 10,000.00 | $ 18,000.00
Alternate 5 - Equipment 272133 Data Communications Wireless $ 36,000.00
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
BID FORM X X X
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FROM SURETY X X X




