
FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
GLENWOOD-NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY "2" - GENERAL TRADES

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR

DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7

Bid Due Date: March 31, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value Adena Alvada Charles Mosser

Bid Package #02 10,624,740.00$               

Addendums Received:

Addendum No. 1  -March 17, 2011 X X X X

Addendum No. 2  -March 24, 2011 X X X X

Addendum No. 3 - March 25, 2011 X X X X

BASE BID: 11,251,000.00$               10,740,800.00$               11,119,000.00$               11,865,000.00$               

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt 60,000.00$                      121,200.00$                    29,000.00$                      24,000.00$                      

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 NO CHANGE NO CHANGE NO BID -$                                 

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS

CONTRACT FORM X X X X

BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X X

POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X X

Glenwood Bid Package No.2  Bid Tabulations - Blank.xls
4/1/2011

2:03 PM



FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
GLENWOOD-NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY "3" - ROOFING

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR

DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7

Bid Due Date: March 31, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value J.B. & COMPANY RAME KELLEY BROS CRM INC

Bid Package #02 1,130,980.00$                 ROOFING

Addendums Received:

Addendum No. 1  -March 17, 2011 X X X X

Addendum No. 2  -March 24, 2011 X X X X

Addendum No. 3 - March 25, 2011 X X X X

BASE BID: 1,529,884.00$                 1,175,000.00$                 1,250,000.00$                 1,698,000.00$                 

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt NO BID -$                                 N/A N/A

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 NO BID -$                                 N/A N/A

0

0

0

0

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS

CONTRACT FORM X X X X

BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X X

POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X X

Glenwood Bid Package No.2  Bid Tabulations - Blank.xls
4/1/2011

2:03 PM



FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
GLENWOOD-NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY "4" - FOOD SERVICE

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR

DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7

THE BRECKENRIDGE BURKETT C&T DESIGN STAFFORD 

Bid Due Date: March 31, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value BEST RESTAURANT WASSERSTROM KITCHEN RESTAURANT AND EQUIPMENT SMITH, INC.

Bid Package #02 393,490.00$                    EQUIPMENT COMPANY EQUIPMENT EQUIPMENT

Addendums Received:

Addendum No. 1  -March 17, 2011 X X X X X X

Addendum No. 2  -March 24, 2011 X X X X X X

Addendum No. 3 - March 25, 2011 X X X X X X

BASE BID: 274,501.00$                    277,328.00$                    251,320.00$                    245,000.00$                    244,625.00$                    253,550.00$                    

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt N/A N/A -$                                 BLANK -$                                 NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 N/A -$                                 BLANK -$                                 NO CHANGE

0

0

0

0

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS

CONTRACT FORM X X X X X X

BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X X X X

POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X X X X

Glenwood Bid Package No.2  Bid Tabulations - Blank.xls
4/1/2011

2:03 PM



FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
GLENWOOD-NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY "5" - FIRE PROTECTION

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR

DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7

ABSOLUTE ACCEL FIRE

Bid Due Date: March 31, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value FIRE PROTECTION VULCAN DALMATION FIRE SYSTEMS, 

Bid Package #02 196,950.00$                    INC. ENTERPRISES INC. INC

Addendums Received:

Addendum No. 1  -March 17, 2011 X X X X

Addendum No. 2  -March 24, 2011 X X X X

Addendum No. 3 - March 25, 2011 X X X X

BASE BID: 198,600.00$                    122,712.00$                    247,000.00$                    202,887.00$                    

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt -$                                 NO CHANGE -$                                 -$                                 

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 -$                                 NO CHANGE -$                                 -$                                 

0

0

0

0

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS

CONTRACT FORM X X X X

BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X X

POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X X

Glenwood Bid Package No.2  Bid Tabulations - Blank.xls
4/1/2011

2:03 PM



FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
GLENWOOD-NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY "6" - PLUMBING

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR

DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7

L.R. BABCOCK

Bid Due Date: March 31, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value PLUMBING &

Bid Package #02 1,057,650.00$                 HEATING

Addendums Received:

Addendum No. 1  -March 17, 2011 X

Addendum No. 2  -March 24, 2011 X

Addendum No. 3 - March 25, 2011 X

BASE BID: 1,126,370.00$                 

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt BLANK

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 BLANK

0

0

0

0

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS

CONTRACT FORM X

BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X

POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X

Glenwood Bid Package No.2  Bid Tabulations - Blank.xls
4/1/2011

2:03 PM



FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
GLENWOOD-NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY "7" - HVAC

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR

DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7

Bid Due Date: March 31, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value VM SYSTEMS VAUGHN

Bid Package #02 2,640,640.00$                 INC INDUSTRIES

Addendums Received:

Addendum No. 1  -March 17, 2011 X X

Addendum No. 2  -March 24, 2011 X X

Addendum No. 3 - March 25, 2011 X X

BASE BID: 2,931,000.00$                 2,612,000.00$                 

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt BLANK NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 BLANK 92,000.00$                      

0

0

0

0

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS

CONTRACT FORM X X

BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X

POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X



FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
GLENWOOD-NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY BID CATEGORY "8" - ELECTRICAL

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR

DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7

Bid Due Date: March 31, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value VAUGHN LAKE ERIE SOLLMANN WOOLACE

Bid Package #02 2,374,900.00$                 INDUSTRIES ELECTRIC ELECTRIC ELECTRIC

Addendums Received:

Addendum No. 1  -March 17, 2011 X X X X

Addendum No. 2  -March 24, 2011 X X X X

Addendum No. 3 - March 25, 2011 X X X X

BASE BID: 2,463,000.00$                 2,599,505.00$                 2,524,305.00$                 2,686,000.00$                 

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt NO CHANGE -$                                 NO CHANGE NO CHANGE

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 92,000.00$                      59,000.00$                      78,534.00$                      81,000.00$                      

0

0

0

0

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS

CONTRACT FORM X X X X

BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X X

POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X X



FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS
GLENWOOD-NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY COMBINATION BIDS

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR

DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7

WARNER

Bid Due Date: March 31, 2011 2:30 PM Charles MECHANICAL

Bid Package #02

Addendums Received:

Addendum No. 1  -March 17, 2011 X X

Addendum No. 2  -March 24, 2011 X X

Addendum No. 3 - March 25, 2011 X X

COMBINATION BASE BID:

Plumbing & HVAC 4,068,000.00$                 

General Trades & Roofing 12,574,000.00$               

Plumbing & HVAC & Electrical

ALTERNATE  BIDDING

ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt 29,000.00$                      -$                                 

ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 NO BID -$                                 

0

0

0

0

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS

CONTRACT FORM X X

BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X

POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X

Glenwood Bid Package No.2  Bid Tabulations - Blank.xls Bid Item #COMB
4/1/2011

2:03 PM


