FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS

DONNELL-NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY

BID CATEGORY "2" - GENERAL TRADES

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 B 4 5 6 7
Bid Due Date: April 28, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value Charles Construction Telamon Adena
Bid Package #02 $ 11,251,870.00
Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1 -April 5, 2011 X X X

Addendum No. 2 -April 12, 2011 X X X

Addendum No. 3 -April 14, 2011 X X X

Addendum No. 4 -April 21, 2011 X X X

Addendum No. 5 -April 25, 2011 X X X
BASE BID: $ 10,846,000.00 | $ 11,094,000.00 11,212,000.00
ALTERNATE BIDDING
ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt $ 17,200.00 | $ 26,000.00 37,000.00
ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 NO BID NO CHANGE NO CHANGE
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X X X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X




FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS

DONNELL-NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY

BID CATEGORY "3" - ROOFING

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 B 4 5 6 7
Bid Due Date: April 28, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value CRM, INC. KERKAN ROOFING KELLEY BROTHERS RAME, INC.
Bid Package #02 1,070,500.00 ROOFING
Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1 -April 5, 2011 X X X X

Addendum No. 2 -April 12, 2011 X X X X

Addendum No. 3 -April 14, 2011 X X X X

Addendum No. 4 -April 21, 2011 X X X X

Addendum No. 5 -April 25, 2011 X X X X
BASE BID: $ 1,135,000.00 1,054,833.00 | $ 911,000.00 1,039,000.00
ALTERNATE BIDDING
ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt N/A BLANK N/A NO CHANGE
ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 N/A BLANK N/A NO CHANGE
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X X X X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X X




FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS

DONNELL-NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY

BID CATEGORY "4" - FOOD SERVICE

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 8 4 5 6 7
BURKETT
Bid Due Date: April 28, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value BRECKENRIDGE C&T DESIGN RESTAURANT LOUIS R POLSTER STAFFORD WASSERSTROM BEST RESTAURANT
Bid Package #02 444,920.00 KITCHEN EQUIP & EQUIPMENT EQUIPMENT COMPANY SMITH, INC COMPANY EQUIP & DESIGN
Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1 -April 5, 2011 X X X X X X X
Addendum No. 2 -April 12, 2011 X X X X X X X
Addendum No. 3 -April 14, 2011 X X X X X X X
Addendum No. 4 -April 21, 2011 X X X X X X X
Addendum No. 5 -April 25, 2011 X X X X X X X
BASE BID: $ 254,366.00 | $ 242,990.00 | $ 244,000.00 260,700.00 259,210.00 286,953.00 | $ 264,831.00
ALTERNATE BIDDING
ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt N/A NO CHANGE BLANK BLANK NO CHANGE N/A BLANK
ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 N/A NO CHANGE BLANK BLANK NO CHANGE N/A BLANK
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X X X X X X X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X X X X X




FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS

DONNELL-NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY

BID CATEGORY "5" - FIRE PROTECTION

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 B 4 5 6 7
Bid Due Date: April 28, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value ABSOLUTE FIRE VULCAN

Bid Package #02 229,090.00 PROTECTION ENTERPRISES
Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1 -April 5, 2011 X X
Addendum No. 2 -April 12, 2011 X X
Addendum No. 3 -April 14, 2011 X X
Addendum No. 4 -April 21, 2011 X X
Addendum No. 5 -April 25, 2011 X X
BASE BID: $ 244,605.00 | $ 171,490.00
ALTERNATE BIDDING
ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt BLANK NO CHANGE
ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 BLANK NO CHANGE
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X




FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS

DONNELL-NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY

BID CATEGORY "6" - PLUMBING

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 B 4 5 6 7
Bid Due Date: April 28, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value SLAGLE L.R. BABCOCK MARLIN WHITE
Bid Package #02 866,150.00 MECHANICAL PLBG & HTG & SONS
Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1 -April 5, 2011 X X X

Addendum No. 2 -April 12, 2011 X X X

Addendum No. 3 -April 14, 2011 X X X

Addendum No. 4 -April 21, 2011 X X X

Addendum No. 5 -April 25, 2011 X X X
BASE BID: $ 1,087,000.00 923,866.00 | $ 928,000.00
ALTERNATE BIDDING
ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt $ - BLANK N/A
ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 $ - BLANK N/A
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X X X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X




FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS

DONNELL-NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY

BID CATEGORY "7" - HVAC

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 B 4 5 6 7
Bid Due Date: April 28, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value VAUGHN SLAGLE WARNER HOFFMAN & VM SYSTEMS, INC
Bid Package #02 2,736,890.00 INDUSTRIES MECHANICAL MECHANICAL HARPST, INC
Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1 -April 5, 2011 X X X X X

Addendum No. 2 -April 12, 2011 X X X X X

Addendum No. 3 -April 14, 2011 X X X X X

Addendum No. 4 -April 21, 2011 X X X X X

Addendum No. 5 -April 25, 2011 X X X X X
BASE BID: $ 2,958,000.00 3,160,000.00 3,048,424.00 3,140,000.00 3,140,000.00
ALTERNATE BIDDING
ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt $ - - NO BID - BLANK
ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 $ 67,300.00 - NO BID - BLANK
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X X X X X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X X X




FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS

DONNELL-NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY

BID CATEGORY "8" - ELECTRICAL

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 B 4 5 6 7
Bid Due Date: April 28, 2011 2:30 PM Budget Value KOESTER ELECTRIC WESTFIELD SOLLMANN WOOLACE VAUGHN
Bid Package #02 2,351,530.00 ELECTRIC ELECTRIC CO ELECTRIC INDUSTRIES
Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1 -April 5, 2011 X X X X X

Addendum No. 2 -April 12, 2011 X X X X X

Addendum No. 3 -April 14, 2011 X X X X X

Addendum No. 4 -April 21, 2011 X X X X X

Addendum No. 5 -April 25, 2011 X X X X X
BASE BID: $ 2,649,000.00 2,572,000.00 | $ 2,235,239.00 2,620,000.00 2,461,000.00
ALTERNATE BIDDING
ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt $ - - NO CHANGE - -
ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 $ 78,500.00 81,344.00 | $ 65,070.00 72,000.00 67,300.00
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X X X X X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X X X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X X X X




FINDLAY CITY SCHOOLS

DONNELL-NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL

FINDLAY, OH

BID TABULATION SUMMARY

COMBINATION BIDS

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
DESCRIPTION 1 2 8 4 5 6 7
Bid Due Date: April 28, 2011 2:30 PM Charles Construction SLAGLE
Bid Package #02 MECHANICAL
Addendums Received:
Addendum No. 1 -April 5, 2011 X X
Addendum No. 2 -April 12, 2011 X X
Addendum No. 3 -April 14, 2011 X X
Addendum No. 4 -April 21, 2011 X X
Addendum No. 5 -April 25, 2011 X X
COMBINATION BASE BID:
Plumbing & HVAC 4,149,000.00
General Trades & Roofing $ 11,893,000.00
Plumbing & HVAC & Electrical
ALTERNATE BIDDING
ALTERNATE #01 - Concrete in lieu of asphalt $ 17,200.00 -
ALTERNATE #02 - CAT 6A cabling in lieu of CAT 6 NO BID -
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
CONTRACT FORM X X
BID GUARANTY/CONTRACT BOND X X
POWER OF ATTORNEY FOR SURETY X X




